
Bid Tabulation: RFB 40-17NOV20 -· 

Copy Paper Term & Supply 

Bid Tabulation 

4.10.1 Paper, Copy: Xerox 4200 DP 

(No Substitution Allowed) 

8 ½" x 11/ 20-pound. 

White bond copy paper, dual 

purpose, long grain, minimum 

brightness 92, SOO sheets 

per ream, 10 reams per case. 

4.10.2 Paper, Copy: Xerox 4200 or 

equivalent: Generic 8 ½" x 11," 20-

pound. 

White bond copy paper, dual 

purpose, long grain, minimum 

brightness 92, 500 sheets per ream , 

lOreamspercase. 

4.10.3 Paper, Copy : Xerox 4200 or 

equivalent 

8 ½" x 11", 3-hole punch, 20-pound. 

White bond copy paper, dual 

purpose, long grain, minimum 

brightness 92, 500 sheets 

per ream, 10 reams per case. 

4.10.4 Paper, Copy : Xerox 4200 or 

equivalent 

8 ½" x 14", 20-pound. 

White bond copy paper, dual 

purpose, long grain, minimum 

brightness 92, 500 sheets per ream, 

lOreams per case. 

4.10.5 Paper, Copy: Xerox 4200 or 

equivalent 

11" x 17", 20-pound. 

White bond copy paper, dual 

purpose, long grain, minimum 

brightness 92, 500 sheet s per ream, 5 

reams per case 

4.10.6 Paper, Copy: Multipurpose 

Colored 

8 ½'" x 11", 20 pound, 500 sheets per 

4 .10:7 To1al0Price 
jAdd together the extended totak for 

line,.items 4,10.Hhrough4.10.-6) 

4.10.8 Percent off list for any paper 

products not listed herein: 
____ % 

4.10.9 Maximum Percentage Increase 

in Total Cost for any renewal period : 
___ % 

Shall be applied to original pricing if 

Co-Op 

QTY 

223 

282 

28 

612 

Office Essentials Staples, Inc. St. Louis Print Group 

32.70 $ 35.25 

No Bid 

29.95 $ 27.99 

No Bid 

32.60 $ 33 .19 

No Bid 

40.90 $ 41.99 

No Bid 

32.60 $ 33.29 

No Bid 

4.20 $ 4.38 

No Bid 

19,744.00 $ 19,899.47 

No Bid 

20% No Response 

No Bid 

5% No Response 

No Bid 


